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Registration is changing
Have your say on our proposals for:
· adult care home workers
· residential family centre support workers
· residential child care workers
· social care managers
· payment of registration fees

Consultation closes on 20 December 2019















Contact details


Social Care Wales
South Gate House
Wood Street
Cardiff CF10 1EW

Tel: 0300 3033 444     
Minicom: 029 2078 0680
Email: info@socialcare.wales
socialcare.wales
© 2019 Social Care Wales

All rights reserved. No part of this publication may be reproduced, stored in a retrieval system or transmitted in any form or by any means without the prior written permission of Social Care Wales. Enquiries for reproduction outside the scope expressly permitted by law should be sent to the Chief Executive of Social Care Wales at the address given above.

Other formats: This document is available in large text or other formats, if required. Copies are also available in Welsh.


About you/your organisation

1 

Are you responding to this consultation:

	1. as an individual
	☐	or
	1. on behalf of an organisation
	☐
	

	If as an individual, are you a/an:
	
	
	Is the organisation:
	

	Social care manager
	☐	
	Central or devolved government
	☐
	Social care worker
	☐	
	A local authority
	☐
	Social worker
	☐	
	A health sector organisation
	☐
	Social work student
	☐	
	An employer
	☐
	Individual using care and support
	☐	
	A learning provider
	☐
	Member of the public	
	☐	
	Other – please describe below:

	Employed by NHS Wales
	☐	
	


	Learning provider
	☐	
	

	Carer
	☐	
	

	
	
	Organisation name/type of work carried out:

	Other – please describe below:
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Adult care home worker registration


Do you agree with the proposal to allow adult care home workers to register using the qualifications listed in the existing qualification framework? 

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐

Please use the space below for any comments:
	














3 
3.7 

Do you agree with our proposal to allow adult care home workers who do not hold one of the recognised qualifications to register initially using the Principles and Values Award?

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐

Please use the space below for any comments:
	






Do you agree with our proposal for a temporary confirmed competence route between 2020 and 2022, which will allow experienced adult care home workers to register without the need to complete a formal qualification?

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐

Please use the space below for any comments:

	









Practice guidance for adult care home workers

Do you think the standards and the expectations on workers set in the practice guidance are reasonable and achievable?

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐


[bookmark: _Hlk17880737]Please provide your comments in the space below:
	






















Do you think there are any gaps in the content of the practice guidance?

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐

Please use the space below to tell us about any gaps:
	




















Residential family centre support worker registration

Do you agree with the proposal to allow residential family centre support workers to register using the qualifications listed in the existing qualification framework? 

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐

Please use the space below for any comments:
	






5 
5.3 










Do you agree with our proposal to allow residential family centre support workers who do not hold one of the recognised qualifications to register initially using the Principles and Values Award?  

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐

Please use the space below for any comments:
	






















Changes to residential child care worker registration


Do you agree with our proposal to allow residential child care workers who do not have a recognised qualification to register initially using the Principles and Values Award?  

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐


Please provide your comments in the space below:
	





















Changes to social care manager registration
5 
6 
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Do you agree with our proposal to register a social care worker or other registered professional as a manager if they are enrolled on the level 4 qualification when another manager is unavailable to a service?  

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐

Please provide your comments in the space below:
	














Do you agree with our proposal to register those who hold a recognised qualification for registration with the relevant regulator as a social worker, nurse or occupational therapist, along with a generic management qualification with the conditions set out above?

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐
 
Please provide your comments in the space below:
	




















The payment of fees
Do you agree with our proposal to introduce provisional registration for years two and three of an individual’s three-year registration? 

This would mean their registration in these years would only become active once we have received the appropriate fee. 

Yes          ☐	
No            ☐

Please add any comments here:
	




















The future of registration in Wales

We welcome your views on our ideas for a more streamlined Register. 
Are broader categories relating to those working in adults’ or children’s social care more appropriate than the current separate sub-categories? Or do you support the idea of creating four categories within our Register – social worker, social care manager, social care worker and social work student?
We would particularly welcome your views on the benefits and risks this might present. 

	



















Do you agree with our suggestion of grouping managers of regulated services in a single category on the Register, called ‘social care manager’? 

[bookmark: _GoBack]Yes          ☐	
No            ☐
[bookmark: _Hlk18656657]
Please provide your comments in the space below:
	




























We would like to know your views on the effects that all the proposals in this consultation will have on the Welsh language, specifically on: 

i) opportunities for people to use Welsh 
ii) treating the Welsh language no less favourably than the English language. 

What effects do you think there would be? How could positive effects be increased or negative effects be mitigated? 

Please provide your comments in the space below:
	




















How we will use your views

Any response you send us will be seen in full by our staff dealing with the issues this consultation covers. It may also be seen by other members of staff to help us plan future consultations. 

We will be publishing a summary of the responses to this document. We may also publish responses in full. Normally, the name and address of the person or organisation who sent the response are published with the response. This helps to show that the consultation was carried out properly. If you do not want your name or address published, please tell us this in writing when you send your response. We will then blank them out.

[bookmark: _Toc493085377][bookmark: _Toc493085464][bookmark: _Toc493085384][bookmark: _Toc493085471][bookmark: _Toc493085385][bookmark: _Toc493085472][bookmark: _Toc493085386][bookmark: _Toc493085473][bookmark: _Toc493085387][bookmark: _Toc493085474][bookmark: _Toc493085388][bookmark: _Toc493085475][bookmark: _Toc493085390][bookmark: _Toc493085477][bookmark: _Toc493085397][bookmark: _Toc493085484][bookmark: _Toc493085401][bookmark: _Toc493085488][bookmark: _Toc493085402][bookmark: _Toc493085489][bookmark: _Toc493085403][bookmark: _Toc493085490][bookmark: _Toc493085404][bookmark: _Toc493085491][bookmark: _Toc493085405][bookmark: _Toc493085492][bookmark: _Toc493085406][bookmark: _Toc493085493][bookmark: _Toc493085407][bookmark: _Toc493085494][bookmark: _Toc493085408][bookmark: _Toc493085495][bookmark: _Toc493085409][bookmark: _Toc493085496][bookmark: _Toc493085410][bookmark: _Toc493085497][bookmark: _Toc493085412][bookmark: _Toc493085499][bookmark: _Toc493085417][bookmark: _Toc493085504][bookmark: _Toc493085418][bookmark: _Toc493085505][bookmark: _Toc493085419][bookmark: _Toc493085506][bookmark: _Toc493085420][bookmark: _Toc493085507][bookmark: _Toc493085422][bookmark: _Toc493085509][bookmark: _Toc493085427][bookmark: _Toc493085514][bookmark: _Toc493085428][bookmark: _Toc493085515][bookmark: _Toc493085429][bookmark: _Toc493085516][bookmark: _Toc493085430][bookmark: _Toc493085517][bookmark: _Toc493085432][bookmark: _Toc493085519][bookmark: _Toc493085436][bookmark: _Toc493085523][bookmark: _Toc493085437][bookmark: _Toc493085524][bookmark: _Toc493085438][bookmark: _Toc493085525][bookmark: _Toc493085440][bookmark: _Toc493085527][bookmark: _Toc493085441][bookmark: _Toc493085528][bookmark: _Toc493085443][bookmark: _Toc493085530]Names or addresses we blank out might still get published later, though we do not think this would happen very often. The Freedom of Information Act 2000 and the Environmental Information Regulations 2004 allow the public to ask to see information held by many public bodies, including Social Care Wales. This includes information that has not been published. However, the law also allows us to withhold information in some circumstances. If anyone asks to see information we have withheld, we will have to decide whether to release it or not. If someone has asked for their name and address not to be published, that is an important fact we would take into account. However, there might sometimes be important reasons why we would have to reveal someone’s name and address, even though they have asked for them not to be published. We would get in touch with the person and ask their views before we finally decided to reveal the information.



2
 
image1.emf









image2.emf









